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ATTACHMENT F 

 

Pool Guests & Fees/Party Policy/Pool Party Form 
 
POOL GUESTS 
 
The pool is always open to Members during operating hours - no parties can use the pool 
exclusively. 
 
Number of Guests and Fee - Members (including Trial Members) can have up to 10 pool guests 
(meaning 10 guests for the Membership). Guests will be charged per the Guest Fees for Pool 
below (must be recorded on Guest Log). 
 
Guests who are full-time residents outside of Calhoun County are not restricted to the three-visit 
limit. 
 
GUEST FEES FOR POOL 
 
Memberships and Trial Memberships may have up to 10 guests at the Pool at any one time per 
the following fee schedule.  More than 10 guests require a Pool Party form (Attachment F) to be 
competed and authorized before the visit may occur. 
 
The fees for guests are NOT charged for Children under the age of 6 years.  However, all guests, 
including all children regardless of age, do count toward the 10 guest limit over which a Pool 
Party request is required. 
 
Trial Memberships may have up to 10 guests present without a Pool Party form at the rate of 
$7.50 per guest. Each guest can visit the Club a maximum of three times per year. The use of the 
Club by a Membership’s out-of-town guests, as defined as a person(s) with a permanent 
residence outside of Calhoun County, shall not be restricted to the three times restriction. 
 
Full Memberships may have (4) guests using the facilities on a particular day without charge.  
Guests of a Regular Member in excess of 4 require payment of a $7.50 fee per guest.  Each guest 
can visit the Club a maximum of three times per year. The use of the Club by a Membership’s 
out-of-town guests, as defined as a person(s) with a permanent residence outside of Calhoun 
County, shall not be restricted to the three times restriction. 
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ATTACHMENT F 
 
PARTY POLICY 
 
Pool parties do not include use of the kitchen or interior seating areas other than the rest rooms 
without express permission.  See application below. If use of those areas is desired, please also 
submit a Clubhouse Rental Agreement   (Attachment D) for review. 
 
Pool parties with application must be made at least thirty (30) days prior to the event and it must 
be directed to a member of the Board of Directors (Attachment H).  Email is acceptable.  The 
requestor must confirm the Board Member’s receipt of the information and must obtain written 
approval of the request. Submission can be on this form or a separate email. 
 
POOL PARTY FORM / APPLICATION 
Completion required when over 10 guest.  All guests are charged $5 each except children under 
6 are free. 
 
Name __________________________________________________________________ 
 
Address ________________________________________________________________ 
 
Telephone ______________________   Email Address ___________________________ 
 
Date of the Party (MM/DD/YYYY) ___________________________________________ 
 
Starting Time (allow for set up time as required) ____________________________AM/PM 
 
Ending Time (allow for cleanup and removal) ______________________________AM/PM 
 
Number of Guests 21 years or older________ Number of Guests under 21 years) ________ 
  
Will you require access to  Kitchen 
     Clubhouse 
 
Will you require/use a certified server?   Yes (name)_____________________________ 
 
      No (No alcohol served or consumed) 

  
Guests must be accompanied by a sponsoring adult Member/Trial Member and are the 
responsibility of that sponsor. Members must make their guests aware of the Pool and Club 
Rules.  Guests must be logged in. 
 

Board approval (sign and dated): 

 

________________________________________________________  


